
 

                                                                                                          
AGENDA ITEM NO.   11                                   

    
 Report To: Policy & Resources Committee 

   
Date:            29 March 2011  

 Report By:            Chief Financial Officer Report No:   FIN/30/11/AP/KJ  
   
 Contact Officer:   Alan Puckrin Contact No:  01475 712223  
   
 Subject:                TREASURY MANAGEMENT PRACTICES – TRIENNIAL REVIEW  
   
   

1.0 PURPOSE  
   

1.1 The purpose of this report is to seek approval for revised Treasury Management Practices 
which are required to be reviewed by Committee every 3 years. 

 

   
   

2.0 SUMMARY  
   

2.1 The Council have adopted the CIPFA “Treasury Management in the Public Services Code 
of Practice” and have, as required by the Code, established Treasury Management 
Practices (TMPs). 

 

   
2.2 The TMPs contain the main principles required to be included by the Code and also     

set-out how those principles are complied with and put into effect by the Council. 
 

   
2.3 The TMPs are required to be reviewed at least every 3 years. The last full review was in 

2008 and so a review is required in 2011. 
 

   
   

3.0 RECOMMENDATIONS  
   

3.1 It is recommended that the Committee approves the revised Treasury Management 
Practices. 

 

   
3.2 It is recommended that the Committee delegates authority to the Chief Financial Officer to 

make changes to the Treasury Management Practices, as required, to reflect any future 
changes in organisational structures, bankers, treasury consultants, technology or credit 
worthiness selection methodology. 

 

   
 
  Alan Puckrin 
  Chief Financial Officer 



 
4.0 BACKGROUND  

   
4.1 Inverclyde Council has adopted the CIPFA “Treasury Management in the Public Services – 

Code of Practice” which sets out good practice for treasury management governance and 
which was revised in late 2009. 

 

   
4.2 The Code of Practice requires that the Council produces and updates a Treasury 

Management Practices document (“TMPs”) which must contain the main principles required 
to be included by the Code and also set-out how those principles are complied with and put 
into effect by the Council. 

 

   
4.3 The TMPs were last reviewed in 2008 and so a review is required in 2011.  

   
   

5.0 COMMENTS ON REVISED TREASURY MANAGEMENT PRACTICES  
   

5.1 The TMPs have been revised and restructured in accordance with revisions to the Code of 
Practice requirements which, e.g., placed additional emphasis on Credit and Counterparty 
Risk Management and on the existing requirement to ensure security and liquidity of funds 
invested before considering the returns to be received from those investments. 

 

   
5.2 The TMPs include improvements to the methodology for selecting counterparties with which 

the Council will invest funds. These changes, as suggested by the Council’s treasury 
advisers to all their clients, have been operated since 2009 and are now being formally 
included in the TMPs document. 

 

   
5.3 The TMPs also reflect changes to the arrangements for Treasury Management reports to 

Committee and full Council (as implemented in April 2010) as well as organisational changes 
within the Treasury function. 

 

   
   

6.0 REQUEST FOR DELEGATED AUTHORITY  
   

6.1 The TMPs are used as an operational document and so must be flexible to deal with 
changes affecting the operation of the Council’s treasury management activities. Delegated 
authority is therefore being sought for the Chief Financial Officer to make changes to the 
Treasury Management Practices, as required, to reflect any future changes in organisational 
structures, bankers, treasury consultants, technology or credit worthiness selection 
methodology. 

 

   
   

7.0 IMPLICATIONS  
   

7.1 Legal: None. 
 
Financial Implications: None.  
 
Human Resources: None. 
 
Equalities: None. 

 

   
   

8.0 CONSULTATIONS  
   

8.1 None.  
   

9.0 LIST OF BACKGROUND PAPERS  
   

9.1 CIPFA - Treasury Management in the Public Services – Code of Practice and Cross-Sectoral 
Guidance Notes – Second Edition 2009. 
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